
As part of your enhanced services profile, you 
will be able to provide families the ability to plan 
a cremation online. Display packages, services, 
and products, with or without prices — you get to 
determine the services and products you want to 
offer. Cremation customers are price shoppers, 
and many discount cremation brands put prices 
online that are so low. Now is your chance to 
compete!

Cremation Options
Give families a choice by offering direct 
cremation, as well as a funeral or memorial 
service. You set the prices, including whether you 
offer a discount for shopping online, or a special 
price for preneed sales.

Merchandise Catalog
Show a selection of product images such as urns, 
cremation containers, jewelry, memorial gifts, 
flowers, and more. Give exact prices, ranges, or 
no price at all—it’s up to you.

Price Estimator
Give customers the information they need to 
know they can afford your services. It doesn’t 
have to be an exact receipt, just enough for them 
to know you’re in their price range. 

Lead Generation Form
Customer information is sent directly to you and 
your staff with all of their preferences itemized in 
the email for easy follow up. 

  Want them to check out on site with a credit 
card? Let us know.

ARRANGE CREMATIONS ONLINE 

CREMATION ARRANGEMENT PORTAL
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LIMITED TIME LAUNCH PRICE

Cremation with Confidence™ enhanced services profile......................................................................................... $450 
Enhanced services profile with cremation arrangement portal..................................................  ($200 savings) $950

Prices are for one time set up fee only.

PLUS: Get your FREE Digital Marketing Kit, full of social media posts and more, designed especially 
 to tell families that you are the ONLY Cremation with Confidence™ firm in town.

Questions?
888.655.1566  •  info@cremationwithconfidence.com

AVAILABLE FOR PURCHASE




